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Hahn Student Services is located in the 
center of campus, south of Quarry 
Plaza and the Bay Tree Bookstore.

Those arriving by Metro bus should 
use the Cowell College bus stop; those 
using the campus shuttle can exit at 
Quarry Plaza.  Those driving should 
use the main entrance to campus, turn 
left onto Hagar Drive, turn left onto 
Steinhart Way, and then immediately 
take the left-hand fork that heads 
downhill to the Hahn Student Services 
parking lot.

The Hahn Student Services parking lot 
has 21 paystation parking stalls, three 
accessible spaces, and a large number of 
spaces for “A” permit holders. 

Parking permits are required in most 
lots on weekdays between 7:00 a.m. 
and 8:30 p.m. Lot designations are 
subject to change; it is advisable to 
check the permit requirements posted 
at parking lot entrances when parking 
on campus.  

One-day visitor permits may be 
purchased at the main entrance Kiosk, 
or at the TAPS Sales Office located in 
the H Barn at the base of campus. 
Parking meters are posted regarding 
hours of enforcement.
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